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21st Annual Rock ‘n Roll Bash – All Star Band Lineup 
 
 
Jeff Adams – Bass Player, Vocalist, and Songwriter.  Born and raised in New York 
City, Jeff began playing original music at the age of 16 and has never looked back.  
He is best known for his work with the supergroup Starship, and has collaborated 
with some of the top names in the industry, including Jimi Jamison (Survivor) and 
has performed at the Rock and Roll Hall of Fame. 
 
Andy Burton – Keyboardist and Producer.  Andy has traveled the globe on 
numerous major tours and has worked with a variety of major musicians over his 
illustrious career, including John Mayer, Ian Hunter, Cindi Lauper, Warren Haynes, 
Tommy Byrnes, and Little Steven and the Disciples of Soul.  
 
Ricky Byrd – Guitarist, Vocalist and Songwriter and Producer.  He spent over a 
decade as a member of Joan Jett and the Blackhearts, where he contributed to 
music and background vocals to two platinum albums, I Love Rock ‘n Roll and Up 
Your Alley.  Ricky has performed, recorded, or toured with Roger Daltrey, Paul 
McCartney, Ringo Starr, Alice Cooper, Bruce Springsteen, and numerous other 
artists, and is Musical Director for this year’s Rock ‘n Roll Bash.  He was inducted 
into the Rock and Roll Hall of Fame in 2015 with Joan Jett and the Blackhearts. 
 
Steve Conte – Guitarist, Vocalist, Songwriter and Music Producer.  Formerly lead 
guitarist of the New York Dolls.  Performed and sang on numerous films, television 
soundtracks, commercials, and has been recorded with J. Geils Band’s Peter Wolf, 
James Brown’s Maceo Parker, and rock legend Suzi Quatro. 
 
Liberty DeVitto – Rock Drummer.  Liberty is best known for his work as a drummer 
for New York singer-songwriter Billy Joel’s recording and touring band for 30 years.  
In addition to his work with Joel, Liberty as also been an active session musician 
with acts such as Paul McCartney, Carly Simon, Phoebe Snow, Karen Carpenter, 
Stevie Nicks, Rick Wakeman, Bob James, and Meat Loaf.  In 2014 he was inducted 
into the Long Island Music Hall of Fame.  
 
Christine “Beehive Queen” Ohlman – Vocalist, songwriter, recording artist.  Long-
running vocalist for the Saturday Night Live Band for over 30 years.  The Beehive 
Queen of blue-eyed rock ‘n soul, who grew up loving the sweetness of a Memphis 
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horn line and the raunch of an electric guitar riff.  She has performed with Elvis 
Costello, The B-52’s, Bruce Springsteen, Brian Wilson, Graham Nash, Big Brother 
and the Holding Company, and many more legendary artists. She also rocked the 
2012 Rock ‘n Roll Hall of Fame induction concert, the Carnegie Hall tribute to the 
Rolling Stones, and has been Master of Ceremonies for numerous Casey Cares 
Rock ‘n Roll Bash events.  She was inducted onto the New England Music Hall of 
Fame in 2022. 
 
Derek St. Holmes – Rhythm Guitar, Lead Guitar, Vocalist.  Born in Detroit, 
Michigan, Derek is best known for songwriting, touring, rhythm guitar and lead 
vocals for Ted Nugent.  He also performed and collaborated with The Michael 
Schenker Group, Brad Whitford (Aerosmith), and Paul Reed Smith.  Derek’s guitar 
work and vocals are truly legendry!  
 
Ron “Bumblefoot” Thal – Guitarist, Songwriter, and producer.  He is currently the 
guitarist for the progressive metal supergroup Sons of Apollo, including Billy 
Sheehan, Derek Sherinian, Jeff Scott Soto, and Mike Portnoy.  In April 2019, it was 
announced that Ron had joined Asia as lead vocalist and guitarist for the bands 
touring lineup and would lead the band until 2022.  He also toured the U.S. and 
Europe for Lita Ford. He was one of two lead guitarists in Guns N’ Roses from 2006 
until 2014.  He performed on their sixth studio album Chinese Democracy, and 
world tour, and the Appetite for Democracy tour. 
 
Uptown Horns – their work is legendary – having performed, toured, and 
recorded with some of the most highly regarded Rock ‘n Roll, Pop, and R&B artists 
in music industry history.  The band features Crispin Cioe and Arno Hecht on 
Saxophones, Bob Funk on Trombone, and Larry Etkin on Trumpet.  They have 
toured/recorded with the Rolling Stones, James Brown, Joe Cocker, Tom Waits, 
Iggy Pop, Joan Jett, Robert Plant, Robert Palmer, J. Geils Band, Elvis Costello and 
many more. 
 


